
FIRE-EMS LOG 
 

 
Friday, June 26 
 
6:38 am: Deputy Chief Jim Moore responded to a Railroad Street business for an odor of natural gas. No 
hazards were found. 
 
2:10 pm: The ambulance responded to a motor vehicle crash on Washington Street. There were no 
injuries and two patient refusals were obtained. 
 
4:05 pm: The ambulance responded to a medical on Summer Street. One patient was transported to 
Milford Regional Medical Center. 
 
7:44 pm: Weekend Duty Officers Captain Michael Curnyn and Lieutenant Dan Moulton responded to an 
investigation at a Bayberry Lane residence. 
 
 
Saturday, June 27 
 
11:26 am: Deputy Chief Jim Moore, Captain Michael Curnyn and Lieutenant Dan Moulton responded to 
Prentice Street for a fire alarm sounding. A heat detector in the kitchen was the cause of the alarm. 
 
11:15 pm: Chief Michael Cassidy, the ambulance and paramedics from Events EMS responded to a 
motor vehicle crash at Norfolk and Hill Streets. One patient was transported to Milford Regional Medical 
Center. 
 
 
Sunday, June 28 
 
12:12 am: The ambulance transported a Jerrold Street resident to MetroWest Medical Center, 
Framingham Campus. 
 
4:06 pm: The ambulance responded to Summer Street for an assistance call. 
 
7:01 pm: Weekend Duty Officers Captain Michael Curnyn and Lieutenant Dan Moulton responded to an 
Adam Wheeler Lane residence for a carbon monoxide detector activation; no hazards were found. 
 
8:17 pm: Weekend Duty Officers Captain Michael Curnyn and Lieutenant Dan Moulton responded to the 
area of Washington and Summer Streets for smoke in the area. An illegal outdoor fire was found on Oak 
Street, the resident was advised of the Open Burning Regulations, and the fire was extinguished. 
 
10:04 pm: The ambulance, along with paramedics from Events EMS, transported a Regal Street resident 
to MetroWest Medical Center, Framingham Campus. 
 
11:47 pm: The ambulance, along with paramedics from Events EMS, transported an Adams Street 
resident to MetroWest Medical Center, Framingham Campus. 
 
 
Monday, June 29 
 
1:05 pm: The fire department responded to a direct alarm at a Washington Street church. The alarm was 
caused accidentally by workers. 
 



1:16 pm: The ambulance, along with paramedics from Events EMS, transported a Washington Street 
resident to MetroWest Medical Center, Framingham Campus. 
 
4:49 pm: Chief Michael Cassidy, Ladder 1, and Engines 1 and 3 responded to a Webster Drive residence 
for a report of smoke in the house. A compressor in a kitchen appliance was the source of the smoke. 
 
8:46 pm: Chief Michael Cassidy responded to a Tracy Lynn Road residence for a carbon monoxide 
detector activation; no hazards were found. 
 
 
Tuesday, June 30 
 
8:05 am: The ambulance, along with paramedics from Events EMS, transported a Green Street resident 
to MetroWest Medical Center, Framingham Campus. 
 
8:43 am: The ambulance transported a Prospect Street resident to MetroWest Medical Center, 
Framingham Campus. 
 
 
Wednesday, July 1 
 
10:20 am: The ambulance transported a Cedar Street resident to MetroWest Medical Center, 
Framingham Campus. 
 
4:30 pm: Chief Michael Cassidy assisted a Goulding Street resident. 
 
8:53 pm: The ambulance transported an Underwood Street resident to MetroWest Medical Center, Natick 
Campus. 
 
9:19 pm: Chief Michael Cassidy, along with Engine 3, responded mutual aid to Sherborn to provide 
station coverage.  The Sherborn Fire Department was committed to a structure fire on Maple Street. 
 
 
Thursday, July 2 
 
1:45 am: The ambulance responded to a Norfolk Street residence. The patient refused transport and a 
signed patient refusal was obtained. 
 
8:10 am: Engine 2 responded mutual aid to the Hopkinton to provide station coverage.  The Hopkinton 
Fire Department was committed to a structure fire on Daniel Shays Drive. 
 
8:19 am: Chief Michael Cassidy, Deputy Jim Moore, Engine 4 and Engine 1 responded to a residential 
fire alarm activation at a Chamberlain Street residence. There were no hazards; the alarm was caused by 
the thunderstorm. 
 
8:33 am: Chief Michael Cassidy responded to an alarm activation at a Kuniholm Drive industrial building. 
No hazards were found. 
 
8:35 am: Ladder 1 responded mutual aid to Medway to assist at a working fire at the West Medway 
Community Church. 
 
2:45 pm: Chief Michael Cassidy responded to an alarm activation at a Kuniholm Drive industrial building. 
The alarm was caused when a forklift knocked a pull station off a wall. 
 
 


